
Subject: Re: Good job
Posted by Aircraftkiller on Fri, 20 Jun 2014 20:47:27 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

Jesse wrote on Fri, 20 June 2014 15:14Aircraftkiller wrote on Fri, 20 June 2014 12:05Grey what?
What straw are you grasping at now, madbro?

Straw? Madbro?

Every single thing I've said in here is a fact and you just bow out to your alpha by saying "ok" like
all the other nerds to not have to face the facts.

Anyone who has ever played renegade with you knows you're the angriest player of all time, the
fact you can call ANYONE mad is just fucking comical.  You're like twice the age of anyone
playing and you make ten times the scene of anyone else. I personally muted you and kicked you
from n00bstories and Jelly at least ten times while I was a mod there. You clearly have issues.  

I can just imagine your daughter now.

"Daddy can we play dolls?"

"NOT NOW SAMANTHA DADDY'S BUSY TALKING SHIT TO 12 YEAR OLDS OVER THE
COMPUTER"

You lead an awesome life for a 35-40 year old.  Mad jealous bro. Everyone here looks up to you,
so I'm sure they're headed down the same path.  Some real winners.  This has been fun for a
while, I think I'll see you in a few months again.  Stay cool.

WILL BE TAKING A TWO WEEK VACATION GOT ANY TIPS FOR COSTA RICA????

You said I have grey hair or something, and I clearly don't lol

I'm also not 35, nor am I 40, nor am I any age above those numbers or within four years of those
numbers - so when I asked what straw you were grasping at, I was referring to your random
flailing to try and figure out just what the fuck you're talking about.

Let's come clean here. It might help your rage issues subside a bit if we do this.

1. I say "ok" because it's funny watching you get pissed off when your soliloquy is interrupted. I
wouldn't even write it if it weren't so effective.

2. With how low the bar is for "rage" these days, I can imagine you look back on your Internet
Memories and see things as being much shittier than they really were. I act in-game very much as
I do on these forums, which is usually a mixture of sarcastic wit and aloofness. It's just how I do.
No rage necessary!

3. I don't remember ever being kicked from Jelly by anyone named Jesse or AnThRaX or
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JesseThrax or AnthJesse or whatever you call yourself or whoever you actually are. This is
assuming if you're actually Anthrax or someone named Jesse or if you're some semi-intelligent AI
designed to write posts on a forum that grasp at straws and don't make a lot of sense.

4. My daughter is playing Sonic 3 in my living room with my wife.

5. Bringing up your Costa Rica trip is a nice humblebrag. This assuming you're actually going at
all - and if you are, it's obviously not something you paid for. You're like Obama, actually. Or at
least the caricature that you've made him out to be. So you sponge off your mom and dad and
have yet to experience anything in life except being a failure at college, one of the easiest events
in one's life. That's pretty pathetic lol

A little birdie told me about some private conversation you had with them and how you're a
compulsive liar, especially regarding your racism. One time you were trying to talk about some
world events they had no idea about because they didn't give a shit and spent more time caring
about Renegade. You got really angry about being ignored in favor of Renegade. You said, "You
care more about fucking Renegade than the fact that some n1gger is driving this country into the
ground."

You, summed up: 
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