
Subject: Re: Jesus
Posted by warranto on Mon, 28 Aug 2006 12:39:06 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

Quote:Is this all a project for you and your Church?

Are you getting a badge for demonstrating a willingness to discuss religion?

Are you getting a furher badge for imposing on us your interpretation, just as all Jehovahs
witnesses and mormons do?

Nothing here is being proven, merely ripped apart slowly but surely like a Jack-Russel with a huge
bone.

You started the topic....

Quote:Yet still you have not answerewd a simple question or are you avoiding it.

You say that you believe in a book that you are not allowed to see? therefore the book could be
full of blank pages and still you believe in it?

Actually ask a question, and I will attempt to answer it.

I can see the book whenever I want. (Looks over to bible, opens it) Oh? It has pages with words
that I can actually see!

Quote:The effect is consistant with all radios within a mile of mine. Consistancy. 

If consistancy is all that matters, people have been quite consistant in the belief that God exists.
Far longer than people have been telling us radio waves exist.

Quote:HOW/WHY is irrelevant.

Sorry, but you're wrong here. How and why are the most important factors of understanding the
truth of something. Why do you think people believed that rain was caused directly by a supreme
being for so long? No one bothered to answer the why or how for themselves... they just decieded
to believe the why and how that someone else of authority told them.

Quote:umans have measurable quantities. We live, we die. We have a weight and height. We
occupy a certain amount of space at one given point in time. We can bench press a certain
amount of weight. We can measure how large our muscles are. How many words per minute we
type, etc. The list goes on.

Those are aspects of the human. Not the human itself. If you want to use the aspects of
something to prove it's measurability, we could use the universe itself to "measure" God. The only
problem is, we can not readily identify what God is reponsible for in order to measure it.
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The human, itself can not be measured. We are not just chemicals making up a body. There are
still a multitude of unkowns that prevent us from measuring ourselves.

Apply this to your next statement as well.

Quote:I've read lots of things in my life not, and I've learned that not everything I've read is true.
Even works of non-fiction have been falsified. How do you know his name was Jesus? It could
have been Bob or Tom or Joe or Dover or Warranto. How do you know? 

I don't. But then again, how do you know that the person named "George Washington", actually
had that name? How do you know that ANY historical figure actually had the name it did. If you
question one historical text, you have to question them all.
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